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Since the 1970s the world has 
entered into a systemic crisis as a 
consequence of the exacerbation of 

global problems. A food crisis com-
mences after the world energy crisis. 
Only in the 1980s were common 
approaches found to the use of the World 
Ocean, but the regime of significant ter-
ritorial expanses such as the Arctic, 
Antarctic, and Caspian remains frozen. 
The problem of the movement of people 
is exceedingly urgent, reflected in flows 
of migrants unprecedented in world his-
tory, especially to wealthy States of 
Europe and America. The number of 
refugees in the world exceeds 20 million. 
The process of overcoming ecological 
problems is moving forward slowly. 

The world community has not suc-
ceeded in overcoming basic crisis phe-
nomena, although their pace has slowed 
somewhat. The third Millennium inher-
ited the entire negative legacy of the 
twentieth century; however, this is not a 
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legacy with which one can live or coex-
ist. Global problems must be overcome 
through the common efforts of the entire 
world community. For many States an 
awareness of this fact is already com-
monplace, but for Ukraine these are 
challenges to the stability of a young 
State that will verify its capacity to real-
istically evaluate the modern threats to 
world civilization and effectively col-
labourate in overcoming them. 

Ukraine facts the priority task of find-
ing and taking its place in the modern 
world. After Ukraine acquired her inde-
pendence, precise foreign policy priori-
ties were lacking for an extended period, 
which caused significant damage to the 
State and levelled the diplomatic the 
diplomatic orientation points which 
should have been taken advantage of 
individually from the former Soviet 
republics. It should be emphasized that 
these priorities have not only political 
importance, but also legal since this is 
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linked with the State entering into a 
series of respective international treaties 
whose norms will be needed for internal 
development. Here are several examples: 
Ukraine became a Member of the 
Council of Europe in 1995; however, 
fully-fledged integration into the princi-
pal mechanisms of that international 
organization continued for nearly seven 
years. The adaptation of Ukrainian legis-
lation to the United Nations Convention 
on Refugees lasted almost ten years. The 
implementation of the anti-corruption 
conventions of the Council of Europe is 
proving to be exceedingly complex. 

Among the more significant chal-
lenges for Ukraine is the energy problem, 
the resolution of which must proceed 
primarily in the political and economic 
context. But one should not overlook the 
legal levers with the assistance of which 
the State seeks to overcome the actions 
of energy monopolies. For example, one 
of these levers for Europe is the Energy 
Charter, whose principles should under-
lie relations with the suppliers of energy 
resources. World experience in reducing 
the energy capacity of industry and the 
legal mechanisms applied should be 
immediately investigated and the results 
introduced into Ukrainian practice. 

Of vital importance for Ukraine 
remains the problem of the legal uncer-
tainty of its territory. The existence of 
territory is axiomatic for a State. But 
Ukraine is among the few States with 
partially undelimited boundaries. The 
'egal indefiniteness of the boundary line 
:s simultaneously the indefiniteness of 
significant territorial expanses such as 
:he Sea of Azov and the Kerchensk Strait. 
Ukraine has no territorial claims, but the 
indefiniteness of the State boundaries of 
Ukraine is linked with the territorial 
interests of neighbouring States. 

The legal indefiniteness and trans-
parency of boundaries is facilitated by 
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the fact that Ukraine, in the view of 
influential international organizations, is 
becoming one of the basic transit States 
for illegal migration into Central and 
Western Europe. The problem of illegal 
migration and related human trafficking 
is among the lamentable challenges to 
the modern world community. It is evi-
dent that this challenged is for Ukraine 
not an abstract one and that Ukraine 
must provide an answer to it. 

Significant for the Ukrainian State is 
the issue of its place in the geopolitical 
distribution of roles on the Eurasian 
mainland. Ukraine is encircled by states 
who are very aware of their own nation-
al interests and exert significantly more 
efforts to realize them. The active 
involvement of Ukraine in extinguishing 
separatist conflicts is explicable not only 
by the interest in eliminating hotbeds of 
instability, but also her own State inter-
ests. The ability of a State to lead in the 
performance of these functions testifies 
to its capacity to guarantee the preserva-
tion of stability at least on its own fron-
tiers. 

The world has long since discussed 
the crisis of parliamentarianism. Al-
though this has been an urgent issue for 
decades, it is crucial today with the 
strengthening of integration processes. 
The crisis of parliamentarianism became 
central to European political systems 
when politicians and scholars compre-
hended that collegial representative 
institutions were incapable of resolving 
urgent problems of State administration. 

The crisis generated another phenom-
enon inherent to modern European con-
stitutionalism — delegated lawmaking. 
One of the effective means of resolving 
this issue is so-called «rationalized par-
liamentarianism), perhaps consolidated 
for the first time in the 1958 French 
Constitution. A state of affairs when the 
Government not only decrees a decision 
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instead of parliament but also deter-
mined the agenda for the Government 
(about 90% of draft laws adopted are 
prepared and submitted by a governmen-
tal team) is now common in the 
European democracies. But does this 
model resolve all the problems arising as 
a consequence of parliamentary ineffi-
ciency? French scholars have frequently 
pointed out that with the enhanced 
effectiveness of State administration the 
leading role of parliament as the national 
representative institution and its author-
ity in society have gradually declined, so 
it is doubtful that a parliament under 
any conditions should remain the 
«forum of nations», an organ capable of 
consolidating all the leading political 
forces thanks to guaranteed democratic 
triumphs and the affirmation of the 
supremacy of law. A way out has been 
suggested by Finnish legislators, who 
when adopting a new Constitution in 
1999 enhanced the importance of parlia-
ment by strengthening its control and 
foreign policy functions. The conclusion 
is that today the development of state-
hood should concentrate efforts on draft-
ing legislative proposals relating to the 
preservation and development of the 
potential for the control and foreign pol-
icy components in the activity of the 
Ukrainian parliament. 

The constitutional process com-
menced in Ukraine placed on the agenda 
a number of urgent issues, the answer to 
which must be given not only by politi-
cians and the general public, but also by 
expert legal scholars. The experience of 
European constitutionalism and practice 
of Ukrainian State construction demon-
strate the need to take account of and 
combine in the machinery for the adop-
tion and drafting of a new or a new ver-
sion of the Fundamental Law of Ukraine 
two important principles, professional-
ism and legitimacy. The first must be 

provided by drafting and giving prior 
approval to a new Constitution by 
experts and parliamentarians, and the 
second by confirming the new Basic Law 
in a national referendum. 

One of the key issues in this contest 
is the structure of State institutions, 
especially the national representative 
organ — the Verkhovna Rada of 
Ukraine. A qualitative break-through in 
building a genuinely democratic State 
order is linked chronologically with the 
development of parliamentarianism in 
Ukraine. The reasons for the crisis of 
the Ukrainian parliamentary system lies 
not in the erroneousness of the idea of 
parliamentarianism, but in the inade-
quacy of the approaches to the structure 
of parliament itself and the means by 
which it is formed, and these lie in the 
weakness and «adolescent state» of the 
party system. The strategic orientation 
of improving Ukrainian parliamentari-
anism may become a movement towards 
bi-cameralism, which, on one hand, 
would ensure the proper representation 
in the Verkhovna Rada of Ukraine of 
the interests of the regions of Ukraine, 
and, on the other, the specialization of 
chambers in the activity of parliament 
and the grown of professionalism in 
lawmaking. 

The next issue which needs resolu-
tion in the course of constitutional form 
is to develop effective machinery for 
constitutional-law responsibility It also 
is essential to address the proper inter-
action of various branches of the State 
in order to ensure the principle of unity 
in the realization of public authority. In 
this context the long-discussed issue in 
specialist doctrinal writings of relegat-
ing a number of control institutions to a 
particular branch of the State should be 
resolved. We speak of the State 
Prosecution, the Ombudsman and the 
Counting Chamber; their functions 
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should be combined into a single section 
of the Constitution. 

Local self-government is a relatively 
new object of constitutional regulation. 
A century ago constitutional texts con-
fined themselves to regulating the forms 
of the State and the fundamental princi-
ples of the legal status of the individual, 
leaving issues of local importance to the 
domain of legislation or to subordinate 
legal acts. However, the strengthening of 
local self-government and expansion of 
its competence has forced the legislator 
to reconsider the position. Therefore, 
constitutions which were adopted after 
:he Second World War (so-called «third 
generation» constitutions) contain a sec-
tion or chapter devoted to the founda-
:ions of local self-government. The 1996 
Constitution of Ukraine is no exception. 
Nonetheless, at the time it was adopted 
many issues of principle remained unre-
solved with regard to the organization 
and activity of municipal power. 
Accordingly, the section devoted to 
these problems turned out to be more 
general and incomplete; there are no 
..nswers in it to many important ques-
tions defining the system and function-
ing of local self-government. 

In the period which has elapsed since 
:iae 1996 Constitution of Ukraine was 
enacted many events have transpired 
which materially changed the status of 
local self-government and, indeed, the 
very attitude of the State authorities and 
the public to this institution: ratification 

і the 1985 European Charter of Local 
Self-Government; adoption of a Law 
-On Local Self-Government in Ukrai-
ne»; and other laws relating to the organ-
ization and exercise of municipal power; 
the legal, territorial, land material-finan-
:ial foundations of local self-government 
have been formed. A situation has come 
into being when the constitutional foun-
dations of local self-government has 

begun to lag behind the true state of 
affairs in this subsystem of public power, 
the further development thereof has 
slowed down, and the dissatisfaction of 
territorial communities caused by this is 
entirely justified. As a result, the forming 
of the existing system of local self-gov-
ernment in Ukraine is an organic compo-
nent of constitutional reform and an ade-
quate reaction to the challenges of the 
modern day. 

On the constitutional level, munici-
pal reform in Ukraine should be regard-
ed, on one hand, as an element of improv-
ing the territorial organization of power 
and, on the other, as a reflection of mod-
ern political and legal trends in its devel-
opment. One must bear in mind that 
local self-government is one of the most 
dynamically developing institutes of 
constitutional law. The basic content of 
the reforms being introduced is the fur-
ther strengthening of local self-govern-
ment and a reinforcement of its autono-
my in resolving a broader range of ques-
tion and, when possible, the fullest use of 
its democratic potential to more fully 
ensure the rights, freedoms, and legal 
interests of the members of territorial 
communities. 

While reforming local self-govern-
ment, a number of complex tasks con-
nected with the need for a structural 
reorganization of public authority must 
be resolved, among them the diversifica-
tion and decentralization thereof, the 
implementation of administrative-terri-
torial reforms, the creation of proper 
conditions for encouraging the develop-
ment of local self-government, and 
improving the material-financial provi-
sion for local and regional development. 

The successful resolution of the finan-
cial problems of local self-government 
and increasing the economic prosperity 
of the inhabitants of the city, village, or 
settlement are impossible without 
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improving actively the legislative regula-
tion of socio-economic transformations, 
changing the procedure for the norma-
tive determination of capital invest-
ments and budget transfers, facilitating 
the increase of the revenue component of 
local budgets by strengthening the sys-
tem of local taxes and charges, equalizing 
the possibilities for the realization 
throughout the territory of the State of 
the minimum level of social standards, 
and creating conditions for the origin 
and development of innovation activity 
of agencies of local self-government. 

No less important in municipal 
reform is the restoration of the regional 
level of local self-government, the form-
ing of executive agencies of regional and 
district soviets, granting them respec-
tive powers and essential material and 
financial resources, as the European 
Charter of Local Self-Government 
requires. It is essential to make a precise 
distribution of competence between 
local agencies of public power on the 
basis of the principle of subsidiary and 
to complete the redistribution of powers 
between agencies of local self-govern-
ment and local State administrations 
and self-governing agencies of various 
territorial levels. 

Realization of the reform requires not 
only improvement of the legislative 
foundation of the activities of local agen-
cies of State power and agencies of local 
self-government, but also the adoption of 
new laws («On the Administrative-
Territorial Structure»; «On Municipal 
Property»; «On Conducting State-Law 
Experiments with Regard to Local and 
Regional Development»; and others). In 
addition, the creation of analytical struc-
tures for investigating problems of terri-
torial development is necessary, forming 
State and regional information systems 
on the regions, their potential and needs, 
and the organization of permanent scien-

tific support for proposals and the imple-
mentation of regional and municipal 
reform. 

Yet another issue which we fact in the 
twenty-first century is preserving 
national originality and a determinative 
principle of every democratic system — 
power of the people. This issue may be 
formulated otherwise: how to avert the 
dissolving of popular sovereignty within 
world integration processes? A reliable 
guarantee should be the consolidation at 
the constitutional level and in interna-
tional agreements of a precise list of 
questions with regard to which powers 
are transferred to supranational agencies 
(together with a substantiation of the 
need for granting this extent of compe-
tence), ensuring the extensive participa-
tion of national representative agencies 
in working out and adopting decisions at 
the respective integration level, estab-
lishing the exclusivity of the application 
of the institution of referendum when 
deciding major issues of the activity of 
supranational subjects of the interna-
tional community 

The twenty-first century confronts 
the problem of restraining separatist 
trends and structures. Indicative in this 
context is the governmental crisis in 
Belgium, the basis of which is a national-
religious issue. Ukraine is capable of 
resolving this type of question «around 
the table». However, these moods are 
capable of forming themselves into 
movements, including political ones. 
Here the question may arise of a threat 
to the integrity of the country. To avert 
this situation from arising the adoption 
of a Law «On the Foundations of 
Regional Policy» is an urgent task that 
would enable not only the orientations 
of regional policy to be determined, but 
also for an extended period consolidated 
specific socio-economic measures to bal-
ance the development of regions by tak-
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ing into account the distinctive features 
of each. 

Time is flying by more rapidly in the 
twenty-first century. Entire stages of 
social, scientific, and economic develop-
ment are accommodated in insignificant 
intervals of time. This requires the gen-
erating of ideas that would enable 
Ukraine to take a worthy place in the 
world. The most important are innova-
tive advanced which scholars and spe-
cialists are capable of making. A cardinal 
revision is essential to make provision for 
these processes through economic, 
administrative, and legal reforms. The 
most important, without which changes 
of principle cannot be expected, is that 
the intellectual should become the key 
figure, productive of ideas around which 
an infrastructure will form. Competition, 
which stimulates the need for particular 
innovative changes in goods, work, and 
services, must be the pivotal point for 
intellectual resources to be activated. 

Placing intellect in the epicentre of an 
innovation model requires adequate 
changes in the system of education, sci-
ence, financing, and industry. The intel-
lectual must be cultivated and nurtured 
at the level of mastering the achieve-
ments of European and world science. 
Cardinal changes should be introduced 
in the system of education scientific-
technical activity, and institutes of intel-
lectual property. A productive intellec-
tual must be provided with the manage-
rial services and financing necessary for 
the generation of ideas. Production must 
be so arranged that innovative proposals 
are perceived in a timely manner and 
their rapid introduction secured. 

The need for a change in the constitu-
tional foundations of innovation policy 
in Ukraine is evident with adequate pro-
vision for the legal apparatus thereof. 
This is an enormous work, but without 
:his major advances should not be antic-

ipated. Movement towards the 
European community, the desire for car-
dinal changes, will not enjoy success in a 
legal milieu where obsolete schemes of 
the past period are retained together 
with a modern approach towards intro-
ducing new legal models. 

Nonetheless, it should be stressed 
that no modifications and changes in leg-
islation should disturb integral cate-
gories which are immutable. One cannot 
make reference to justness and the 
supremacy of law while violating the law 
and legal fundamental principles. The 
normative-legal base and legal milieu 
must be carefully devised with a view to 
bringing order to economic and intellec-
tual activity as priority factors in the 
development of Ukraine. Such activity 
in the legal domain must be orientated 
towards restoring confidence in law and 
the social machinery for its application. 

The modern state of the natural envi-
ronment causes disquiet for the entire 
world and for Ukraine. Despite measures 
being taken, it continues to deteriorate. 
We refer to changes in the qualitative 
state of individual natural resources and 
to the environment as a whole. Under 
these circumstances, the realization of 
the right of each of us to a safe environ-
ment is becoming more complicated. 
Ecological conditions under the impact 
of anthropogenic activity always experi-
enced changes brought by ecological 
crises of various dimensions. However, 
under modern conditions the scientific-
technical revolution has materially 
expanded in extent and possibilities, and 
the intensity of the influence of society 
both on the natural environment and on 
profound properties and structures of 
the earth has increased. 

A specific feature of the modern eco-
logical situation is that the crisis points 
are becoming greater for Ukraine and 
elsewhere. As a result, an ecological ten-
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sion is actually arising which is creating 
a danger directly to the existence of 
mankind. A priority task is the need to 
transform the preservation and regenera-
tion of the natural environment as a 
common system for human life. 

When natural processes cannot 
secure support for the dynamic function-
ing of the «nature-society-nature» sys-
tem, only society itself can perform the 
respective function of regulator. Society 
must act as the decisive factor in pre-
serving the earth's biosphere and the 
plant as a whole. A moral and aesthetic 
re-evaluation of the relationship of each 
person and society as a whole to the 
environment is required. We refer to the 
need for the gradual formation of an eco-
logical consciousness. 

In representing the interests of socie-
ty and performing an ecological function, 
the State must determine the legal forms 
for regulating social relations which arise 
in the process of determining affiliation 
to nature objects and their use, repro-
duction, and protection of the natural 
environment and ensure ecological secu-
rity. This social activity should further 
the strengthening of the interaction of 
society and nature on a scientifically-
substantiated level, and also facilitate 
the real reflection of their interaction. 
The modern ecological-legal prescrip-
tions which are being formed on a new 
basis in principle and founded on the 
doctrine of human rights are absolutely 
needed in an adequate codification of 
legislation. 

The Conception of National Ecolo-
gical Policy of Ukraine for the Period to 
2020 calls for the adoption of an 
Ecological Code of Ukraine and compli-
ance with its basic requirements as a 
major instrument of national ecological 
policy. Completion of the codification of 
ecological legislation of Ukraine would 
enable the necessary conditions to be 

created for its constant development and 
for participation in international cooper-
ation in the sphere of protection of the 
natural environment. 

It should be emphasized that the 
nature and dynamics of the development 
of contemporary ecological relations 
which require not only a regional but a 
global reach. Since a high degree of the 
ecological interdependence of States 
within individual regions and between 
them is leading to the headlong escala-
tion of many national and international 
ecological problems, their resolution in 
the twenty-first century is possible sole-
ly at the international level. The integra-
tion of Ukraine and the European Union 
may be realized by means of the systemic 
improvement and bringing Ukrainian 
legislation into conformity with 
European legal, normative-methodologi-
cal, and institutional base of ecological 
management and ecological security. 

The twenty-first century is an era of 
globalization which is influencing 
national criminal-law doctrines. The 
challenge to the international communi-
ty is terrorism and transnational crimi-
nality. Human trafficking, crimes con-
nected with narcotics, smuggling, and 
other types of socially-dangerous acts 
transcending national boundaries repre-
sent a danger not only for individual 
countries, but mankind as a whole. 
Under these conditions the combining of 
the efforts of States is essential to wage a 
common effective struggle with crimi-
nality 

The strengthening of interdepart-
mental cooperation of law enforcement 
agencies of member countries is occurred 
at the level of the European Union and 
the formation of special supranational 
structures (Eurojust, Europol) whose 
task is to combat organized crime and 
establish direct contacts between them 
and member countries. 
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The intentions of Ukraine with 
regard to European integration require 
>tandardization of the forms and meth-
ods of combating organized crime pur-

suant to the approaches of the European 
Union and the Council of Europe and 
•Jso in adopting common procedures for 
:ounteracting organized crime and other 
iangerous crimes. In accordance with 
the 2000 European Convention on 
Mutual Assistance in Criminal Matters, 
active measures are being taken to 
mcrease the efficiency and effectiveness 
: f various forms of legal assistance when 
investigating crimes committed on the 

territories of various countries; common 
avestigative groups are being formed 

that include representatives of law 
enforcement agencies of the respective 
:ountries. On the territory of the 
European Union the institute of extradi-
tion of offenders is receding into the past 
_nd a new form of criminal procedural 
:ompulsion is being introduced — a 
European order for arrest, in accordance 
vith which a judicial authorization to 
trtain an offender issued in one country 
: t the European Union operates on the 
territory of all member countries. 

Counteracting organized crime is one 
:nentat ion of the cooperation of 
"-"кгаіпе with members of the European 
Union pursuant to a new EU/Ukraine 
Action Plan adopted 2 February 2005. 
The participation of Ukraine in general 
measures of the European Union in 
: : mbating trans-boundary organized 
groups and criminal organizations is 
mportant. The creation of a legal base 

~:r the accession of Ukraine to new 
rms of international cooperation in 

criminal matters is urgent. It is essential 
t э establish contacts with European law 
enforcement structures — Europol and 
I trojust — and to work out agreements 

th them on cooperation. The adapta-
:n of criminal and criminal procedure 
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legislation to European standards also is 
vital. 

Ukraine needs to develop an adequate 
strategy for counteracting organized 
crime that is based on an analysis of the 
modern state of organized crime and cor-
ruption and takes foreign experience 
into account. Underlying international 
cooperation in the domain of counteract-
ing criminality is the legal provision 
thereof, which is especially vital for law 
enforcement agencies since it is neces-
sary to create an evidentiary base for the 
consideration of cases in court. Bearing 
in mind the absence of legal regulation of 
the relations of Ukraine and European 
supranational law enforcement struc-
tures, a draft law «On Organizational-
Legal Foundations for the Participation 
of Ukraine in European Law 
Enforcement Structures» needs to be 
prepared. The preparation and adoption 
of an International Criminal Code which 
would provide responsibility for the 
most dangerous international crimes 
having a global nature is timely (terror-
ism, information crimes, transnational 
crimes, and others). 

The aspiration of Ukraine to join the 
European Union is affecting the study 
and use in the doctrine of criminal law 
and criminal legislation of the best and 
most useful scientific achievements of 
various countries of the world. This 
work requires targeted joint research by 
scholars of various States, including 
Ukraine. 

The criminal-law aspect of the devel-
opment of legal doctrine is under discus-
sion. Sometimes reference is made to the 
crisis of criminal-law science in publica-
tions and in papers at conferences or 
seminars. This is not so much a crisis as a 
challenge of modern times concerning 
the need to be aware of the problems 
arising and the determination of the 
directions in which science should devel-
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op. Society needs an answer to the tradi-
tional but always urgent question for 
every science: the object and methodolo-
gy of criminal law studies, the organiza-
tion of such studies, and an evaluation of 
their effectiveness and usefulness for 
society and the State. 

Society and the State are interested 
especially in the stability of criminal leg-
islation, which would bear witness to the 
steady and predictable criminal-law pol-
icy of the State. The foundation of stabil-
ity is the quality of criminal law secured 
by the Criminal Code, which by its con-
tent and legal form meets modern 
requirements of society in counteracting 
criminality by criminal-law means. 
Ensuring the quality of the criminal law 
and elabourating criteria for evaluating 
legislation and its application with a 
view to enhancing the effectiveness of 
the prescriptions of the Criminal Code 
and raising the professional standard of 
judges and personnel of law enforcement 
agencies remains one of the major strate-
gic orientations of the development of 
the science of criminal law. 

The dynamics of criminal law are con-
ditioned by many factors, among them 
changes in the socio-economic and polit-
ical conditions of the development of 
Ukraine; the emergence of new types of 
socially-dangerous behaviour and the 
need to study them; the elabouration and 
inclusion in the Criminal Code of pre-
scriptions concerning the punishability 
of a particular type of socially-dangerous 
act; the need for society to decriminalize 
certain acts, that is, renounce deeming a 
particular type of behaviour to be a 
crime; the need to clarify individual pro-
visions, and also eliminate certain «gaps» 
and «conflicts» of the Criminal Code in 
force identified by the practice of its 
application; the need to take account the 
recent achievements of the science of 
criminal law, and others. The dynamism 
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of the science of criminal law is secured 
not only by reacting in a timely manner 
to the objective requirements of society, 
but also in foreseeing them. 

The contemporary trends of criminal-
ity in Ukraine, although they testify to a 
reduced level thereof and positive 
advances in structure, all the same do 
not give grounds for equanimity with 
regard to the cause of the transformation 
of quantitative changes in the indicia of 
criminality into qualitatively new forms 
of criminal behaviour, such as raiding, 
illegal migration, human trafficking, 
smuggling, and corruption. In 2010, 
500.1 thousand crimes were registered 
(.in 2009,434.7 thousand). The dynamics 
of criminality grew at the expense of the 
growth of crimes against ownership. 
Whereas in 2009 243,000 thefts were 
registered, in 2010, there were 318,000, 
which is partly to be explained by leg-
islative vacillation in determining the 
amount of criminally-punishable steal-
ing of property. 

The transition from an administra-
tive-command system of management to 
a market model in Ukraine was intro-
duced rather abruptly; the embryonic 
market relations in the early stage con-
fronted the strong influence of agencies 
of power on economic and social process-
es. As a result, the process of the primary 
accumulation of capital was accompa-
nied by mass violations of legislation in 
force. Property transactions were 
entered into not for production purpos-
es, but speculative, when enterprises 
were taken over for their expensive 
immoveables. Raiding also could be 
explained by the regime of rising prices 
for immoveables and land. 

The complex influence of this social-
ly-dangerous phenomenon was affected 
by the lack of legal responsibility for 
raiding and a precise orientation for 
combating it. This also helps explain 
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guarantees of compliance with the law of 
ownership being ignored and the ineffec-
tiveness of the courts and law enforce-
ment agencies in this respect. Among the 
urgent measures to counteract raiding is 
the need to draft and adopt legislative 
acts to strengthen responsibility and 
eliminate «gaps» in economic and civil 
legislation. 

Without systemic changes in society, 
restructuring the principles of the opera-
tion and interaction of all branches of 
power to overcome corruption will be 
impossible. The present state of legisla-
tion regulating corruption will not 
enable the negative image of Ukraine as 
one of the most corrupt countries of the 
world to be altered. Having provided 
administrative responsibility in 1995 by 
the Law of Ukraine «On the Struggle 
Against Corruption»1 for the commis-
sion of corruption violations without 
taking into account that international-
.egal norms regard many of them as crim-
inally-punishable acts, the legislator 
thereby artificially lowered the percep-
tion of the danger of corruption as an 
extremely negative phenomenon for 
society. 

In 2007 the activity was terminated 
of sixteen organized criminal groups 
which engaged in human trafficking. 366 
victims were returned to Ukraine, of 
whom 55 were minors. During 
2009-2010, 279 and 257 crimes were 
registered respectively connected with 
human trafficking, and 23 organized 
croups and criminal organizations iden-
tified in this connection. In all about 400 
. rganized groups and criminal organiza-
tions were discovered in 2010, including 
torty with international links and six-
teen operating on an ethnic basis which 
ommitted more than 3,000 crimes, 80% 

jf which were grave or especially grave 

Repealed by Law of Ukraine No. 1506-IV, 11 June 2009. 
-:91. as amended. 

crimes (homicide, banditry, assault with 
intent to rob, theft on an especially large 
scale, and others). 

The first seekers of asylum appeared 
in Ukraine even before independence 
was acquired in 1991. Refugees from the 
Azerbaidzhan SSR and Armenian SSR 
arrived in Ukraine during the so-called 
«Karabakh» Conflict in 1988 and 1989. 
The second wave of refugees comprised 
Meskhetian Turks who arrived in 
Ukraine after sanguinary pogroms in the 
Uzbek SSR during the summer of 1989. 
The largest number of refugees came to 
independent Ukraine in 1992 as a result 
of the armed conflict in the Transd-
niester — a region in the neighbouring 
Republic Moldova. Although at the time 
Ukrainian State agencies did not carry 
out a targeted registration of those who 
sought asylum, according to United 
Nations data of 1999 about 62,000 per-
sons crossed the Ukrainian-Moldovan 
border in order to obtain temporary pro-
tection against the war. 

A tense humanitarian situation was 
created by the tens of thousands of per-
sons in the regions of neighbouring 
Moldova — Vinnitsa, Odessa, Cherno-
vits, and Nikolaev Regions, where the 
first steps were taken to legally regulate 
the status of refugees in Ukraine and 
persuaded the legislator to adopt the 
first version of the Law of Ukraine «On 
Refugees» in 1993. Ukrainian legislation 
as a whole met the spirit of international 
standards for the protection of refugees, 
although elements remained that were 
contrary to the international obligations 
of Ukraine. The regulation of the acqui-
sition, loss, and deprivation of the status 
of refugee and the legal and social guar-
antees for refugees and seekers of asylum 
were consolidated in the Law of Ukraine 
«On Refugees». 

Відомості Верховної Ради України (2009), no. 45, item 
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As official statistics of the State 
Border Service of Ukraine testify, about 
3,000 illegal migrants were detained by 
the border guards throughout 2004. Far 
from all knew their rights and duties, in 
particular, their right to asylum. The 
great majority detained in Ukraine were 
economic and labour migrants using 
Ukraine as a transit route to Western 
Europe. Among these people are poten-
tial refugees who have the right to inter-
national protection. The State should 
create an effective system for identifying 
these persons. 

Nonetheless, criminal manifestations 
among migrants are not uncommon. 
During 2006 and 2007, foreign citizens 
committed 3,800 crimes, of which 74 
were intentional homicides, 79 grave 
bodily injuries, 116 assults with intent to 
rob, 285 open stealing, 1,300 thefts, and 
68 illegal taking possession of motor 
vehicle transport. During the last two 
years the unlawful activities of fifteen 
organized groups created on an ethnic 
basis were shut down. Criminality of for-
eign citizens in connection with migra-
tion is not decreasing. 

Ukraine, having ratified the 1965 
International Convention on the 
Elimination of All Forms of Racial 
Discrimination, assumed under Article 4 
of this Convention obligations to declare 
punishable under the law as a crime 
«...all dissemination of ideas based on 
racial superiority or hatred, incitement 
to racial discrimination, ... acts of vio-
lence or incitement to such acts against 
any race or group of persons of another 
colour or ethnic origin ...», and also 
declare illegal and prohibit organizations 
which promote and incite racial discrim-
ination. Criminal responsibility for 
infringement on the rights of man and 
citizen on the basic of racial, nationality, 
and religious intolerance was significant-
ly strengthened in changes to the 

26 

Criminal Code of 17 November 2009 
pursuant to these obligations. 

Although happily criminality on the 
basis of racial, nationality, or religious 
enmity is not so widespread in Ukraine, 
one cannot ignore the great social danger 
of such manifestations. During 2006 and 
2007, 1,430 crimes were registered relat-
ing to foreigners, 33 of them intentional 
homicides, 36 intentional grave bodily 
injuries, 52 assaults with intent to rob, 
188 open stealing, 539 thefts, and 138 
illegal taking possession of motor vehicle 
transport. In 2010 2,269 foreigners were 
deemed to be victims of the said crimes, 
of which 71 perished, that is, criminal 
infringements against foreigners doubled 
in three years. 

The data cited show the need for a 
more detailed analysis of the results of 
increasing responsibility for violations of 
law committed for racial, nationality, or 
religious reasons and continuing work on 
improving the legislation of Ukraine 
(criminal, civil, administrative) to pre-
vent these manifestations. In addition, 
the administrative and disciplinary 
responsibility of officials should be pro-
vided for manifestations of racial, nation-
ality, or religious discrimination which 
are a consequence of their thoughtless 
actions. 

The practice of internal affairs agen-
cies of Ukraine in dealing with crimes in 
the domain of industry shows that crim-
inal elements have recently concentrated 
attention of strategic enterprises with a 
view to obtaining significant profits. In 
order to ensure the energy security of the 
State, attention should be devoted to the 
legality of the use by enterprises of State 
means allotted for the introduction of 
alternative energy sources, restructuring 
State enterprises, installing gas supply in 
population centers, and the calculations 
for consumer energy carriers, and com-
pliance with license conditions when 
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financial and economic activity of struc-
tural subdivisions and subsidiary enter-
prises of State joint-stock companies is 
undertaken. 

In 2007 about 3,000 crimes were dis-
covered at ТЕК objects, including 421 
crimes causing damage in excess of 
100,000 hrivnas. By 2010 677 crimes 
were registered at these same objects, of 
which 149 caused damage exceeding 
100,000 hrivnas. Among the document-
ed crimes, 60% were committed in the 
energy sphere, 23% in the coal industry, 
about 22% in the fuel, oil refining, and 
gas spheres. Although the number of reg-
istered crimes decreases each year, a high 
level of latency remains. 

About 153,000 consumers of nar-
cotics are registered in Ukraine, nearly 
33.3 per 10,000 population. 90% are nar-
cotics addicts, persons up to 30 years of 
age. During the past three years, a posi-
tive trend towards reducing narcotics 
addiction can be observed. However, the 
quantity of seized narcotic means, psy-
chotropic substances, and precursors is 
increasing and international channels for 
receiving narcotics in Ukraine are being 
closed. Regrettably, the predictions for 
the spread of narcotics addition are 
depressing, the more so as narcotics 
addiction is more fashionable among the 
young and is being feminized. The non-
medical consumption of narcotics is 
expanding in all social spheres (workers, 
employees, unemployed, businessmen), 
and the preponderance of grave forms of 
narcotics addition, including poly-addic-
tion, is growing. 

Narcotics addiction is closely linked 
with criminality. Narcotics stupefication 
weakens human self-control, which facil-
itates the commission of a crime. The 
consumption of narcotics and living a 
parasitic way of life requires significant 
means that are most readily obtained by 
crime. Addicts belong to the high-risk 

group of crime victims. It should be 
borne in mind that illegal operations 
with narcotics are in and of themselves 
criminal, as is the maintenance of dens 
for their consumption, and so on. 62,539 
crimes were registered throughout 2010 
in Ukraine in the sphere of the circula-
tion of narcotic means, psychotropic 
substances, analogues and precursors 
thereof, of which a third were catego-
rized as grave or especially grave. 

The present development of the sci-
ence of criminal procedure is determined 
by the need of society to establish the 
legal regulation of social relations capa-
ble of ensuring legal order and the pro-
tection of the rights and interests of each 
person. Strengthening the role of the 
court in a criminal trial, reforming the 
system of pre-judicial investigation 
agencies, expanding adversariality and 
ensuring the rights of participants in a 
court proceeding — these are problems 
whose solution depends not only upon 
the technical legal content of Ukrainian 
legislation, but also on its social orienta-
tion. We have the possibility today, by 
relying on historical and international 
experience and using all of the acquired 
positive potential, to accelerate the 
processes of reform in this domain by 
creating an effective legislative base. As a 
legal form of resolving social conflicts 
arising in connection with the commis-
sion of crimes, a criminal trial is called 
upon to become a procedure which reli-
ably defends all of the participants there-
of against illegal influence on them. 

Enlarging the jurisdiction of the 
court in a pre-judicial proceedings in a 
criminal case is where the science of 
criminal procedure is making efforts, in 
order to ensure the constitutional right 
of each to judicial defense; differentiate 
criminal-procedural forms, introduce 
simplified procedures capable of effec-
tively achieving the purposes of a crimi-
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паї proceeding within reasonable peri-
ods; introducing right-protective machi-
nery with whose assistance the partici-
pants of a trial might uphold their legal 
interests, and improving the system of 
reviewing judicial decisions and correct-
ing judicial errors. 

For modern penal law the primary 
task is the theoretical substantiation of 
recommendations to improve penal legis-
lation, the activity of agencies and insti-
tutions to execute punishments and to 
implement the right-limitations inherent 
in punishment. Scientific studies in penal 
law as a sphere, the process of forming 
which has only commenced, must be fun-
damental. Only on this basis can one 
elabourate the applied research on indi-
vidual specific problems of the activity of 
agencies and institutions which imple-
ment punishments and develop theoreti-
cally-substantiated recommendations for 
the improvement and reform thereof. 

The science of penal law on the basis 
of a comparison of theoretical proposi-
tions with verified practice in implement-
ing punishments in the actual practice of 
penal agencies and institutions makes it 
possible to research law enforcement 
activity as a principal orientation in the 
activity of penal agencies and institutions 
and help draw attention to the substanti-
ation of the realization of right-limita-
tions inherent in punishment. Ultimately 
this will lead to an improved knowledge 
and fuller understanding of the processes 
of penal policies. 

The development of the science of 
penal law is based on new requirements, 
having regard to the effectiveness of the 
activity of penal agencies and institu-
tions to research divergences between 
the theoretical model of «reform and 
resocialization of all convicted persons» 
and social reality. Issues of the real possi-
bility of implementing punishments are 
major cognitive problems of penal law. 

More profound study of the function-
ing of the penal service will make possi-
ble not only a characterization of various 
orientations of its activity, but also a 
determination of whether with the assis-
tance of legal and relevant means the 
tasks put to a penal system can actually 
be resolved, and if so, how the purposes 
of penal agencies and institutions can be 
achieved and what the social purpose of 
a penal system is. This all requires an 
improvement of the legislative base and a 
continuation and deepening of the 
reform of the organizational-legal foun-
dations of the activity of the penal serv-
ice. The principal aim of the reform 
should be the qualitative change and 
enhanced effectiveness of the penal agen-
cies and institutions. 

A primary objective of scientific 
research in penal law is elabourating the 
theoretical-legal provision for reforming 
the penal service. This means that on the 
basis of an integrated analysis of the 
functions of the penal system, scientifi-
cally-substantiated proposals are made 
to the draft Conception of the reform of 
the penal service along these orienta-
tions: improvement of the legislative 
base; organizational measures; reorgani-
zation of the procedure for and condi-
tions of serving punishment; improve-
ment of work with personnel. 

Combating crime is one of the priori-
ty tasks of State criminal-law policy, and 
integral part of which is criminological 
policies. The States of the world have 
been preoccupied with this for centuries; 
however, cardinal success has not been 
achieved, notwithstanding energetic, 
multi-dimensional, substantiated, real, 
specific, and not declaratory, preventive 
measures, well-resources, have produced 
noteworthy positive results. 

The platitude that a wide legislator 
should be more concerning about pre-
ventive, than chastising, activity 
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remains genuine, including in Ukraine. 
It should be stressed that counteracting 
criminality is a urgent task of all branch-
es of power and society. It should be 
based on scientific principles and 
requirements compliance with which is 
essential; otherwise, as world experience 
shows, there will be no-results. However, 
one may speak about the fulfillment and 
results of the Integrated programs for 
the prevention of crime adopted during 
the last fifteen years in Ukraine only rel-
atively. 

In summarizing Ukrainian, foreign, 
and international criminological experi-
ence in combating crime, the guiding 
principles relating to the prevention of 
crime elabourated by United Nations 
congresses for the prevention of crime 
and criminal justice, one may suggest the 
following. 

The prevention of crime should be 
regarded as an obligatory element of 
social policy. What was said by the 
German criminologist, F. von Liszt, con-
tinues to be relevant: the best criminal 
law policy is the best social policy. Only 
an elevated social policy is capable of 
rorming a civil society which is the foun-
dation of a rule-of-law State and of posi-
tively influencing the quality of legal 
order within a State. Society must 
understand these important tenets of 
triminological policy and be interested 
:n strengthening the preventive effect of 
social measures. 

A criminological policy which is not 
rnly the aggregate of strategies and 
measures, but also an ideological genera-
tor enhancing a preventive «tension» in 
society, must promote this, form a social 
tolerance and respect for social values, 
accumulate «social capital» (public 
trder, trust, honor, and so on), without 
•vhich it is impossible to build a rule-of-
law democratic State with a market 
economy. 

The prevention of crime is not an iso-
lated problem which is resolved by sim-
ple and direct methods, but rather an 
broad and complex orientation of activi-
ty requiring systematic strategies and 
differentiated conceptions that take into 
account socio-economic, political, and 
cultural conditions of the society in 
which they are implemented, and also 
the degree of development of society 
with a special accent on changes occur-
ring in it now and possibly will occur in 
the future. 

Often society by various routes gives 
rise to criminal behaviour or increases 
criminogenic potential — a failure to 
provide, poverty of some and lack of con-
trol, mercenary behaviour of others, lack 
of real concern about the «working» 
families and unsupervised children, poor 
schooling and nurturing, ineffective 
work of the State apparatus, and so on. 
These shortcomings may be overcome by 
the proper organization of social life and 
use of modern scientific knowledge, 
including in the domain of combating 
crime. 

State programs should be drawn up 
on the basis of a global, integrated, and 
coordinated approach, determining in so 
doing the short-term or urgent, medium-
term, and long-term (permanent) tasks. 
This makes it possible to evaluate the 
results of realizing the decisions adopted, 
lessen their possible negative economic 
and social consequences, and reduce the 
possibility for the commission of crimes 
while enlarging in so doing the sphere of 
satisfaction of requirements by means of 
law. 

In our view, a reduction of the practi-
cal possibility of committing crimes may 
be achieved by conceptual strategies of 
criminological policies; the resolution of 
complex tasks of adaptation; nurturing 
and informational work in the popula-
tion; interference in crisis situations; 
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involving the general public in preven-
tive activity; counteracting so-called 
«background» phenomena which entail 
social degradation and de-socialization 
not only of individuals, but lead to a 
deterioration of morality and culture of 
all society (child and adolescent delin-
quency, narcotics additions, addiction to 
toxic substances, vagrancy, parasitic way 
of life, victimization, alcoholism, prosti-
tution, legal nihilism, criminal subcul-
ture, sectarianism, begging, and others). 

When devising specific strategies, one 
should proceed from the criminogenic 
situation, the state of criminality, the 
criminogenic potential of members of 
society or parts thereof, the level to 
which the theories of crime prevention 
have been elabourated, the degree of 
resource provision and machinery for its 
distribution, and so on. 

An important step on the way to 
enhancing the effectiveness of crime pre-
vention is the activity of the 
Coordinating Committee for Combating 
Criminality attached to the President of 
Ukraine, which is professionally engaged 
with the planning, control, and coordi-
nation of crime prevention on the 
national and regional levels. Understan-
dably, this work does not reduce merely 
to hearing reports by subjects responsi-
ble for combating crime, as was the case 
previously. 

The mass media and enlightenment 
activity play an important role in imple-
menting strategies for counteracting 
criminality. It is advisable to study and 
assess the role of the mass media and its 
influence on various aspects of crime pre-
vention and the administration of crimi-
nal justice, since an understanding by 
the general public of criminal-law and 
criminological policies and their position 
is a decisive factor in ensuring the effec-

tiveness and justness of the legal system. 
The positive contribution of the mass 
media in informing the public about 
crime prevention and administering 
criminal justice should be encouraged, 
for together with programs of public and 
legal education, learning the norms of 
life in society is important. This concerns 
uncontrolled advertisements of miracle 
drugs, beer, low-alcohol cocktails, and 
the like. Ukrainian narcologists sound 
the alarm: the «face» of Ukrainian alco-
holism is becoming younger — 16 year 
old patients in narcotics clinics surprise 
no one. During the past ten years, beer 
alcoholics in Ukraine have increased ten 
times. The per capita increase in beer 
produces has led to a problem with alco-
hol among 14 and 15-year olds1. 

In the form in which they now exist, 
criminal law statistics are unsuited for 
the effective combating of criminality 
since they have a more popular, familiar-
ization, nature. In, for example, Germany 
a substantial volume is issued annually 
with police criminal statistics which 
contains detailed scientifically-substan-
tiated criminological information about 
crime, its structure, dynamics, geogra-
phy, nature, factors, and so on. 

The introduction of technical means 
to combat crime is more widely encoun-
tered in world practice. New achieve-
ments of science and technology should 
be used in the interests of people and 
thereby in the interests of the effective 
prevention of crime. It should be recalled 
that new technology may influence new 
manifestations of crime. These conse-
quences need to be foreseen and prevent-
ed in advance, rather than combating 
them later. Qualitative changes in crime 
and its taking on a professional, organ-
ized, and more precise character confront 
the science of criminalistics with tasks to 

' E. Romanishin, «Тяжке похмілля від легкого алкоголю» [Grave Consequences of Types of Light Alcohol], Уря-
довий кур'єр, 19 January 2008. 
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elabourate modern methods and means 
for counteracting criminal phenomena. 

On this level the more active and cre-
ative use of criminalistics data of the 
technical and natural sciences should be 
deemed to be more urgent in accordance 
-.vith its tasks: the introduction of such 
innovations in investigative activity as 
digital, photographic, and video tech-
nologies, multimedia devices, distance 
3bservation, and internet technologies. 
This requirement is affected by the large 
number of tasks that need to be resolved 
. ithin relatively brief periods, the insuf-

ficiency of information concerning an 
event being investigated, the lack of reli-
able sources to obtain the information, 
difficulties in interaction with specialists 
and operational-search personnel, and 
resistance to investigations on the part 
зі interested persons. The introduction 
of innovations also will affect the opti-
mization of the investigation and elimi-
nation (or reduction) of investigative 
errors. 

The need to form new and to modern-
ize existing scientific recommendations 
vith regard to the identification and 

investigation of individual types of 
і 'imes is urgent (referring to new crimi-
nal manifestations) on the basis of intro-
incing modern information technolo-
gies, methods of modeling and forecast-
ing, setout out respective recommenda-
tion in more accessible form for the 
investigator, including in the form of cer-
tain algorithmic diagrams, which are 
realized on the base of modern computer 
technologies. 

In determining the orientation of sci-
cntific quests in the domain of criminal-
istics, one must proceed from the 
-equirements of the investigator and 
forensic and expert practice, predictions 

of probable lines of development and 
structural changes in criminal manifesta-
tions, and international experience in 
combating them. These axiomatic asser-
tions do not need superfluous mention, 
but they make sense and need to be made 
because of the disproportion between 
the requirements of practice and doctri-
nal lines of inquiry observed at present. 
Some criminal law scholars as a conse-
quence of labour intenseness, complexi-
ty, and length of time needed for empiri-
cal observations avoid the need to create 
an informational foundation for individ-
ual criminalistics methods «from the 
ground up» and give preference to a cer-
tain «modernization» of work done pre-
viously and relatively «simple» methods, 
without elabourating new ones. This 
«selectiveness» is mistaken, and there-
fore scholars should concentrate their 
attention on developing models for 
investigating crimes committed in the 
credit-financial and banking spheres, 
privatization, processing and food indus-
tries, fuel and energy, and agro-industri-
al complex, as well as crimes against the 
environment. 

In analyzing the reasons which 
obstruct the active introduction of the 
achievements of criminalistics into 
forensic investigative practice, one must 
indicate not only the inadequate level of 
scientific work, but also the conservative 
stereotypes formed in this sphere by 
practical activity and a certain lack of 
desire by practitioners to work «accord-
ing to science». These stereotypes need 
to be overcome, and a decisive step must 
be made by scholars. They need to 
review the recommendations made by 
science since some of them can hardly 
serve as an instrument of practical activ-
ity. 

• OF UKRAINE • 2012 • N° 1~2 • 31 


